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CUSTOMER SERVICE FREECALL 1800 630 877 EMERGENCY RESPONSE (ALL HOURS) FREECALL 1800 630 877

POISON
KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN

READ SAFETY DIRECTIONS BEFORE OPENING OR USING

ACTIVE CONSTITUENT: 18 g/L ABAMECTIN
SOLVENTS: 265 g/L N-METHYL-2-PYRROLIDONE

58 g/L LIQUID HYDROCARBON

For the control of certain mites on cotton, citrus, apples, hops, pears,
tomatoes, ornamentals and strawberries and Native Budworm on cotton.

IMPORTANT: READ THE ATTACHED BOOKLET BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT

CONTENTS 1 Litre

STEALTH*

MITICIDE AND INSECTICIDE

1l  110mm x 160ml

GROUP INSECTICIDE6A
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PROTECTION OF WILDLIFE, FISH,
CRUSTACEANS AND ENVIRONMENT
DO NOT apply under weather conditions, or
from spraying equipment, that may cause
spray to drift from the target area.
Dangerous to fish and other aquatic
organisms. DO NOT contaminate streams,
rivers or waterways with the chemical or
used containers. Dangerous to bees. DO
NOT spray any plants in flower while bees
are foraging.

STORAGE AND DISPOSAL
Store below 30°C (Room temperature).
Store in the closed original container in a
cool, well ventilated area. Do not store for
prolonged periods in direct sunlight. Triple
or preferably pressure rinse containers
before disposal. Add rinsings to the spray
tank. Do not dispose of undiluted chemicals
on site. If recycling, replace cap and return
clean containers to recycler or designated
collection point. If not recycling, break,
crush, or puncture and bury empty
containers in a local authority landfill. If no
landfill is available, bury the containers
below 500 mm in a disposal pit specifically
marked and set up for this purpose clear of
waterways, desirable vegetation and tree
roots. Empty containers and product should
not be burnt.

SAFETY DIRECTIONS
Poisonous if absorbed by skin contact or
swallowed. Will damage eyes. Will irritate
the skin. Avoid contact with eyes and skin.
Do not inhale spray mist. When opening the
container, preparing spray and using
prepared spray, wear cotton overalls
buttoned to the neck and wrist, a washable
hat, elbow-length PVC gloves, and goggles.
For space applications, wear cotton overalls
buttoned to the neck and wrist, a washable
hat, elbow-length PVC gloves, goggles, and
half facepiece respirator with dust cartridge
or canister. If product in eyes, wash it out
immediately with water. After use and before

eating, drinking or smoking, wash hands,
arms and face thoroughly with soap and
water. After each day’s use, wash gloves,
goggles, respirator (and if rubber, wash with
detergent and warm water) and
contaminated clothing.

FIRST AID
If poisoning occurs, contact a doctor or
Poisons Information Centre. Phone
Australia 131126. If skin contact occurs,
remove contaminated clothing and wash
skin thoroughly. If swallowed, do NOT
induce vomiting. Give a glass of water. If in
eyes, wash it out immediately with water.

Material Safety Data Sheet
Additional information is listed on the
Material Safety Data Sheet for Cropro
Stealth Miticide and Insecticide which is
available from PCT on request. Call
Customer Service Toll Free on 1 800 630
877 or visit our web site at http://pct.au.com
NOTICE
PCT warrants that this product conforms to
its chemical description and is reasonably fit
for the purposes stated on the label when
used in accordance with directions for use
under normal conditions of use. No
warranty of merchantability or fitness for a
particular purpose, express or implied,
extends to the use of the product contrary to
label instructions or under off-label permits
not endorsed by PCT, or under abnormal
conditions.

APVMA Approval No:  53511/1L/0907

D.O.M./ Batch No.:

PESTICIDES, LIQUID, 
TOXIC, N.O.S.

(CONTAINS ABAMECTIN)
UN No. 2902

PACKAGING GROUP III
HAZCHEM 2XE
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